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When the person you've built your whole life around is gone, what do you do? It's not the first time Abby
Stone has faced the question. At eighteen, she envisioned a future with her childhood sweetheart, Charlie,
only to have him go off to school and leave a pregnant Abby behind. But that pales beside a second loss,
when her eighteen-year-old son, Luke, falls to his death from his third-floor dorm.

Abby throws herself into running her thriving B&B on the coast of Maine. With the help of Rob, a local
landscape architect, she plans a backyard labyrinth as a memorial to Luke--a place to find peace and solace.
Even as Charlie begins hanging around again, looking for a chance to do right by her, Abby resolves to look
forward, not back. And then Luke's girlfriend arrives on Abby's doorstep--pregnant, as alone as Abby once
was--bringing with her the unexpected gift of a new beginning, one that celebrates the past.

Rich in emotion and insight, this beautifully written novel explores the depth of a mother's bond, resilience
after unimaginable loss, and the way love's memory can fill the gaps in a shattered heart.

Praise for Lorrie Thomson's Equilibrium

"An emotional, complex, and deeply satisfying novel about the power of hope, love, and family. I couldn't
put it down!" --Lisa Verge Higgins

"Tender, heartbreaking and beautifully realistic. Fans of Anita Shreve will be riveted by this intense and
compassionate story." --Hank Phillippi Ryan, Agatha, Anthony and Macavity-winning author

"Fans of Kristin Hannah and Holly Chamberlin will similarly appreciate this hopeful, uplifting story."
--Booklist

"Thomson's debut is riveting." --RT Book Reviews
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From reader reviews:

Gerard Brand:

Many people spending their time by playing outside having friends, fun activity having family or just
watching TV all day long. You can have new activity to shell out your whole day by looking at a book. Ugh,
do you consider reading a book can definitely hard because you have to use the book everywhere? It okay
you can have the e-book, bringing everywhere you want in your Cell phone. Like What's Left Behind which
is getting the e-book version. So , try out this book? Let's notice.

Donn Chavez:

Within this era which is the greater individual or who has ability to do something more are more precious
than other. Do you want to become considered one of it? It is just simple way to have that. What you are
related is just spending your time almost no but quite enough to get a look at some books. Among the books
in the top record in your reading list is actually What's Left Behind. This book and that is qualified as The
Hungry Hillsides can get you closer in turning out to be precious person. By looking way up and review this
reserve you can get many advantages.

Rose Watkins:

That publication can make you to feel relax. This kind of book What's Left Behind was colorful and of
course has pictures around. As we know that book What's Left Behind has many kinds or variety. Start from
kids until youngsters. For example Naruto or Private eye Conan you can read and believe that you are the
character on there. Therefore not at all of book are generally make you bored, any it makes you feel happy,
fun and unwind. Try to choose the best book for you and try to like reading that.

James Crist:

What is your hobby? Have you heard that question when you got learners? We believe that that concern was
given by teacher with their students. Many kinds of hobby, Every individual has different hobby. And you
also know that little person including reading or as examining become their hobby. You have to know that
reading is very important in addition to book as to be the factor. Book is important thing to add you
knowledge, except your teacher or lecturer. You will find good news or update in relation to something by
book. A substantial number of sorts of books that can you choose to adopt be your object. One of them is
What's Left Behind.
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