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Language and Creativity has become established as a pivotal text for courses in English Language,
Linguistics and Literacy.

Creativity in language has conventionally been regarded as the preserve of institutionalised discourses such
as literature and advertising, and individual gifted minds. In this ground-breaking book, bestselling author
Ronald Carter explores the idea that creativity, far from being simply a property of exceptional people, is an
exceptional property of all people.

Drawing on a range of real examples of everyday conversations and speech, from flatmates in a student
house and families on holiday to psychotherapy sessions and chat-lines, the book argues that creativity is an
all-pervasive feature of everyday language. Using close analysis of naturally occurring language, taken from
a unique 5 million word corpus, Language and Creativity reveals that speakers commonly make meanings in
a variety of creative ways, in a wide range of social contexts and for a diverse set of reasons.

This Routledge Linguistics Classic is here reissued with a new preface from the author, covering a range of
key topics from e-language and internet discourse to English language teaching and world Englishes.
Language and Creativity continues to build on the previous theories of creativity, offering a radical
contribution to linguistic, literary and cultural theory. A must for anyone interested in the creativity of our
everyday speech.
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From reader reviews:

Pamela Pinkham:

Do you have favorite book? Should you have, what is your favorite's book? Book is very important thing for
us to be aware of everything in the world. Each publication has different aim or goal; it means that book has
different type. Some people sense enjoy to spend their time and energy to read a book. These are reading
whatever they have because their hobby will be reading a book. What about the person who don't like
looking at a book? Sometime, man feel need book after they found difficult problem as well as exercise.
Well, probably you will need this Language and Creativity: The Art of Common Talk (Routledge Linguistics
Classics).

Robert Schrader:

In other case, little people like to read book Language and Creativity: The Art of Common Talk (Routledge
Linguistics Classics). You can choose the best book if you'd prefer reading a book. As long as we know
about how is important a new book Language and Creativity: The Art of Common Talk (Routledge
Linguistics Classics). You can add information and of course you can around the world by way of a book.
Absolutely right, since from book you can realize everything! From your country till foreign or abroad you
will end up known. About simple thing until wonderful thing it is possible to know that. In this era, we can
open a book or perhaps searching by internet product. It is called e-book. You may use it when you feel
weary to go to the library. Let's study.

Norma Ochoa:

Reading a e-book can be one of a lot of exercise that everyone in the world adores. Do you like reading book
consequently. There are a lot of reasons why people enjoy it. First reading a reserve will give you a lot of
new details. When you read a book you will get new information since book is one of various ways to share
the information or their idea. Second, reading through a book will make an individual more imaginative.
When you reading a book especially fictional works book the author will bring one to imagine the story how
the characters do it anything. Third, you can share your knowledge to other individuals. When you read this
Language and Creativity: The Art of Common Talk (Routledge Linguistics Classics), you may tells your
family, friends as well as soon about yours publication. Your knowledge can inspire the mediocre, make
them reading a guide.

Nolan Russell:

People live in this new day of lifestyle always aim to and must have the spare time or they will get great deal
of stress from both day to day life and work. So , if we ask do people have extra time, we will say absolutely
yes. People is human not really a huge robot. Then we inquire again, what kind of activity do you possess
when the spare time coming to an individual of course your answer will certainly unlimited right. Then do
you ever try this one, reading textbooks. It can be your alternative within spending your spare time, typically



the book you have read is usually Language and Creativity: The Art of Common Talk (Routledge Linguistics
Classics).
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