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This easy-to-read outline review follows the unique two-column Straight A's format that lets students
choose how they study for NCLEX® and course exams. The interior column outlines key facts for in-depth
review; the exterior column lists only the most crucial points for quickest review. Other features include
NCLEX®-style questions at the beginning and end of each chapter; lists of top items to study before a test;
Time-Out for Teaching patient-teaching points; Go with the Flow algorithms; and critical information
highlighted in a second color.

A bound-in CD-ROM contains hundreds of NCLEX®-style questions—including alternate-item format
questions—with answers and rationales.
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From reader reviews:

Lewis Lin:

In this 21st hundred years, people become competitive in most way. By being competitive right now, people
have do something to make these survives, being in the middle of the actual crowded place and notice
through surrounding. One thing that often many people have underestimated this for a while is reading. Yes,
by reading a e-book your ability to survive enhance then having chance to stand up than other is high. For
you who want to start reading a book, we give you this specific Straight A's in Medical-Surgical Nursing
book as starter and daily reading e-book. Why, because this book is usually more than just a book.

Charles Wilkerson:

Are you kind of busy person, only have 10 or maybe 15 minute in your day time to upgrading your mind
talent or thinking skill perhaps analytical thinking? Then you have problem with the book when compared
with can satisfy your limited time to read it because this time you only find e-book that need more time to be
study. Straight A's in Medical-Surgical Nursing can be your answer as it can be read by a person who have
those short free time problems.

Virginia Shrader:

Many people spending their time period by playing outside having friends, fun activity together with family
or just watching TV 24 hours a day. You can have new activity to invest your whole day by looking at a
book. Ugh, think reading a book will surely hard because you have to bring the book everywhere? It okay
you can have the e-book, taking everywhere you want in your Cell phone. Like Straight A's in Medical-
Surgical Nursing which is obtaining the e-book version. So , why not try out this book? Let's notice.

Brian Hill:

What is your hobby? Have you heard in which question when you got pupils? We believe that that issue was
given by teacher to their students. Many kinds of hobby, Everyone has different hobby. And you know that
little person such as reading or as studying become their hobby. You have to know that reading is very
important and book as to be the matter. Book is important thing to incorporate you knowledge, except your
own personal teacher or lecturer. You get good news or update about something by book. Many kinds of
books that can you take to be your object. One of them is this Straight A's in Medical-Surgical Nursing.
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